
City of Bristol
TABULATION OF COMPETITIVE BIDS

Bid Number: 2A11-042
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Bid Opened: 11/8/2010  11AM

Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

1 NAOCL 12% Sol gal 8000 no bid 3.7525 30,020.00  no bid 1.94 15,520.00  2.73 21,840.00  no bid 1.29 10,320.00  1.84 14,720.00  2.99 23,920.00  
Opt1: 55g drums gal no bid 1.9864 no bid 1.94 2.73* no bid 1.29 1.84 1.57
Opt2: Totes gal no bid 1.8701 no bid 1.94 no bid no bid 1.29 no bid 1.74

2 ADOX or equal gal 5000 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 10.57       52,850.00  no bid no bid no bid -            
Opt1: 55g drums gal 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 12.57       no bid no bid no bid
Opt 2: Totes gal 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 12.57       no bid no bid no bid

3 Liq. Polymer gal 47300 0.695 32,873.50  no bid 1.0092 47,735.16  no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

4 Citric Acid 50# bag 50.00  no bid 76.05         3,802.50    no bid 75.885     3,794.25    no bid no bid 63.95       3,197.50    no bid no bid

5 NAOH 20% gal 3025 no bid 1.9884 6,014.91    no bid 4.80         14,520.00  2.73* 8,258.25    no bid 1.19         3,599.75    no bid 1.48 4,477.00    

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            No bid submitted
Appendix A & B *minimum delivery of 

-            -            -            form part of our 8 - 55 gal. drums -            -            -            -            -            
proposal

-            -            -            Appendix A - Force -            -            -            -            -            -            
Majeure Check bid for purchase

-            -            -            Appendix B - Product order address -            -            -            -            -            
Warranty

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            

-            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            -            
Awarded to: Total Amount:

32,873.50                    39,837.41                      47,735.16                    33,834.25                    30,098.25                    52,850.00                    17,117.25                    14,720.00                    28,397.00                    -                               
Cash Discount:

PO # Delivery:

Remarks: 2% 10 days 1% 10 days


	Landscape

