
City of Bristol, CT
Bid Tabulation Results

Bid Number:
Title:
Bid Opened:

Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

Section A. Police Uniforms
1 Trousers (M) #8810 200 51.45      10,290.00       no bid -             
2 Trousers (F) #8810W 5 51.45      257.25            no bid -             
3 Long Sleeve #8703 120 48.75      5,850.00         no bid -             
4 Short Sleeve #8703 120 43.25      5,190.00         no bid -             
5 Dress Trousers (M) #8560 10 59.50      595.00            no bid -             
6 Dress Trs (F) # 8560W 3 59.50      178.50            no bid -             
7 Dress Shirt #8450 20 53.20      1,064.00         no bid -             
8 Dress shirt (F) #8450W 2 53.20      106.40            no bid -             
9 Dreess Shirt (M) 8460 20 48.40      968.00            no bid -             

10 Dress Shirt (F) #8460W 2 48.40      96.80              no bid -             
11 Dress shirt#8900 5 46.00      230.00            no bid -             
12 Dress shirt #8910 5 42.00      210.00            no bid -             

Section B. Academy Requirements
13 Dickie Khaki  #874KH 30 20.25      607.50            no bid -             
14 Dickie Khaki  #874KH XXL 2 20.00      40.00              no bid -             
15 Dickie Shirts #575KH 20 23.00      460.00            no bid -             
16 Dickie Shirts #1575KH 20 23.00      460.00            no bid -             

Section C. Other Clothing
17 Ties Broome $4JJBO Dk Nav 10 4.50         45.00              no bid -             
18 Winter hat 10 22.00      220.00            no bid -             
19 8 Pt. Rain Hat Cover 10 6.00         60.00              no bid -             
20 Jacket, Blauer 6001 10 134.60    1,346.00         no bid -             
21 Raincoat, Blauer #733 10 112.90    1,129.00         no bid -             
22 Cruiser Jkt, Blauer 9010Z 10 222.00    2,220.00         no bid -             
23 Black Knit Cap 10 14.00      140.00            no bid -             
24 BaseballCap #8154X 10 12.00      120.00            no bid -             
25 Baseball Cap - ERT 10 8.90         89.00              no bid -             

Section D. Accessories
26 Mag Flashlight 1 21.00      21.00              23.54      23.54         
27 Cuff Case #7300S 1 17.00      17.00              no bid -             
28 Pepper Holder #7307S 1 14.00      14.00              no bid -             
29 Equipment Duty Belt #7200 1 36.00      36.00              no bid -             
30 Dble Mag. Pouch#7302HS S 1 22.00      22.00              no bid -             
31 Radio Holder #7314 1 23.00      23.00              no bid -             
32 Hinged Handcuffs 1 33.00      33.00              31.97      31.97         
33 Holster Model 261 1 102.95    102.95            no bid
34 Flashlight Holder #6409 1 5.00         5.00                no bid -             
35 Pkg - 4 belt keepers #7406 1 9.50         9.50                no bid -             
36 ASP Exp. Baton #52411 1 74.00      74.00              no bid -             
37 ASP Holder #52432 1 29.00      29.00              no bid -             
38 Glove Holder #7315S 1 16.00      16.00              no bid -             
39 BPB pins - silver 2 13.00      26.00              6.95         13.90         
40 Sergeant - gold 2 8.00         16.00              4.26         8.52           
41 Lieutenant - Gold 2 8.00         16.00              4.26         8.52           
42 Captain Gold 2 8.00         16.00              4.26         8.52           
43 Chief Gold 2 13.00      26.00              4.26         8.52           
44 Name Plate 1 9.00         9.00                7.30         7.30           
45 Pant Belt for Khaki uniform 1 9.00         9.00                no bid -             
46 Velcro Liner Belt #7205 1 20.00      20.00              no bid -             
47 Tie Bar Silver 1 12.50      12.50              no bid -             
48 Tie Bar Gold 1 12.50      12.50              no bid -             
49 Clip Ties, Dk Navy 3 4.00         12.00              no bid -             
50 Lime Grn SafetyVest Blauer 1 37.00      37.00              no bid -             
51 Hatch Resister Gloves #RFK 1 31.00      31.00              no bid -             
52 Badge Hi-Glo B879 Pin Back 1 79.00      79.00              73.72      73.72         
53 Badge RHO-Glo 1 79.00      79.00              73.72      73.72         
54 Hat Badge BA3780 1 59.00      59.00              59.70      59.70         
55 Hat Badge w/ RHO-Glo 1 47.00      47.00              59.70      59.70         
56 Serpa II Paddle Holster 1 40.00      40.00              24.62      24.62         
57 Mag/ single cuff pouch 1 37.00      37.00              no bid -             
58 Badge Holder/Badge Clip 1 11.00      11.00              no bid -             
59 Shooting Glasses 1 13.00      13.00              no bid -             

Section E. Animal Control Officer Uniforms
60 Trousers, Green 3 51.45      154.35            no bid -             
61 Long sleeve shirt 3 52.00      156.00            no bid -             
62 Short sleeve shirt 3 47.00      141.00            no bid -             
63 Jacket, Green 3 129.00    387.00            no bid -             

-                  -             
Total Amount:

402.25                         

Police Uniforms
6/1/2011 11:30

2A11-101

New England Uniform LLC

Lawmen's & Shooters' 

Supply Inc.

33,821.25                         


