City of Bristol, CT
Bid Tabulation Results
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Item  Description UOM  Qty |Unit Price Extension |Unit Price Extension |Unit Price Extension
1 Trousers, dress Elbeco E1360 20|  63.00] 1,260.00 | nobid | nobid |
2 Shirts, dress, long E#580 16|  45.00| 72000 |nobid | nobid |
3 Shirts, dress, short E#5580 16|  41.00| 656.00 | nobid | nobid |
4 Hats, R-8149 Keystone 6 34.00 204.00 | no bid no bid
5  Chest badges #592 Priv. 10]  40.00| 400.00| 37.45| 37450| 32.10 321.00
6 Chest badges, Lt#592 3| 4000 12000 37.45| 11235| 3210 96.30
7 Chest badges, Capt #592 3| 4000 12000 87.45| 11235| 3210 96.30
8 Chest badges, D.Chief #B538 2| s000| 11800] 321| 10642 5250 105.00
9 Hat badges, Pri #B501 10] 39.00] 300.00| 3659 365.90| 33.50 335.00
10 Hat badges, Lt. #A2879 3| 30.00| 11700] s0.01| 15273| 1125 33.75
11 Hat bages, Capt #A2881 3| 3000| 11700] s9.01| 170.73| 1125 33.75
12 Hat badges, Dep. Chief 2| s0.00| 10000] s0.01| 10182 1440 28.80
13 Blouse coat doub brst E1375 4| 178.00 712.00 | no bid no bid
14  Blouse coat sing brst #£1370 4| 175.00 700.00 | no bid no bid
Total Section A: 5,734.00 1,505.80 1,049.90
15 Trousers, work 175 14.00 I 2,450.00 | no bid | no bid |
16  T-shirts #5180 265  6.15] 1,629.75 | nobid | nobid |
17 T-shirts 2XL-4XL 200  7.94| 15880 |nobid | nobid |
18 Shirts, work long (It blue) P878 175|  33.90| 593250 | nobid | nobid |
19  Shirts, work short (It Blue) P868 175 30.75 I 5,381.25 | no bid | no bid |
20 Shirts, work long (F) P802LC 4| 3390| 13560 |nobid | nobid |
21 Shirts, work short (F) P812LC 4 30.75 I 123.00 | no bid | no bid |
22 Sweatshirts, Game #8800 75| 2350 1,762.50 | nobid | nobid |
23 Sweatshirts 2XL-4XL 10| 27.00| 270.00 | nobid | nobid |
Total Section B: 17,843.40 - -
24 Work Shirt Game #810 25| 42.00] 1,050.00 | nobid | nobid |
25 Jackets, Game #9400 25|  38.80] 970.00 | nobid | nobid |
26 Jackets, 2XL-3XL 15|  42.00| 630.00 | nobid | nobid |
27 Dep. Chief North Face HS3334 5| 215.00] 1,075.00 | nobid | nobid |
28 SWAT #1261 5" Zipper 10/ 59.00| 590.00 | nobid | nobid |
29 SWAT #1160 9" Zipper 10/ 5800| 580.00|nobid | nobid |
30 Thorogood 804-6190 6" 10| 64.70| 647.00 | nobid | nobid |
31 Thorogood 804-6191 8" 10/ 68.00| 680.00|nobid | nobid |
32 Thorogood 804-6905 Oxford 10/  90.00| 900.00 | nobid | nobid |
33 Thorogood 831-6027 Dress 5 66 330.00 | nobid | nobid |
34 Ties, Broome, #90001, Blk 20 325| 6500 nobid | nobid |
Total Section C: 7,517.00 - -
Total 31,094.40 1,505.80 1,049.90 |
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