
City of Bristol, Connecticut
TABULATION OF COMPETITIVE BIDS
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Bid Opened: 3/28/2011 11am

ItemDescription UOM Qty
SECTION A Plastic Bags

1 15x9x23 HD Plas cs 100 20.50 2,050.00   16.00 1,600.00   19.93 1,993.00   13.80 1,380.00   26.90 2,690.00   14.14 1,414.00   12.63 1,263.00   15.99 1,599.00   15.95 1,595.00   19.79 1,979.00   24.29 2,429.00   

2 33x39 HD 1.5 mil roll 350 13.87 4,854.50   11.75 4,112.50   12.26 4,291.00   20.40 7,140.00   14.06 4,921.00   6.93 2,425.50   11.17 3,909.50   14.11 4,938.50   24.84 8,694.00   10.7 3,745.00   17.52 6,132.00   

3 38x58 HD Blk 1.5 mil cs 500 23.62 11,810.00 19.55 9,775.00   20.25 10,125.00 15.40 7,700.00   15.00 7,500.00   17.48 8,740.00   18.33 9,165.00   24.16 12,080.00 17.18 8,590.00   17.35 8,675.00   22.96 11,480.00 

4 40x46 HD Blk 1.5 mil cs 400 NO BID -            15.95 6,380.00   15.55 6,220.00   16.60 6,640.00   13.05 5,220.00   15.72 6,288.00   14.20 5,680.00   20.18 8,072.00   15.26 6,104.00   14.53 5,812.00   20.17 8,068.00   

5 24x32 HD 1 mil cs 100 15.19 1,519.00   25.55 2,555.00   27.69      2,769.00   22.40 2,240.00   25.79 2,579.00   23.32 2,332.00   20.94 2,094.00   33.40 3,340.00   15.50 1,550.00   21.80      2,180.00   33.67      3,367.00   

Total Section A 20,233.50 24,422.50 25,398.00 25,100.00 22,910.00 21,199.50 22,111.50 30,029.50 26,533.00 22,391.00 31,476.00 

6 PG33407 "Swiffer" pk 24 NO BID -            9.99 239.76      50.85 1,220.40   NO BID N0 BID NO BID 8.24 197.76      9.98 239.52      60.00 1,440.00   9.20 220.80      49.50 1,188.00   

Total Section B -            239.76      1,220.40   -            -            -            197.76      239.52      1,440.00   220.80      1,188.00   

Awarded to:
Tot Sec. A&B

Remarks:  Non Addendum   Non Addendum   Non Addendum   Non Addendum  
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22,910.00                   21,199.50                   22,309.26                   30,269.02                   20,233.50                   24,662.26                     26,618.40                   25,100.00                   
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