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Title: Safety Products
Bid Opened: 7/21/2010

3:00 PM

Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

Section A Gloves 10            4,248.00    10              3,667.80   10              3,971.07   10            3,918.11   10            3,505.96     10            4,125.75    

Section B Rainwear 8              2,293.55    8                1,663.60   7                2,727.20   7              2,643.75   7              3,129.61     7              2,250.50    

Section C Footwear 4              3,614.52    3                3,691.52   4                3,990.96   4              4,691.20   4              3,864.32     3              4,031.40    

Section D Safety Vests 2              453.75       2                1,110.60   2                774.75      2              1,376.25   2              -              2              1,470.00    

Section E Protective Clothing 1              128.40       1                170.64      1                126.00      1              222.96      1              105.36        1              128.40       

Section F Addtl Raingear 1              448.75       1                575.00      1                1,480.50   1              485.00      1              -              1              443.75       

Total Sections A, C, D, E and F 8,893.42    9,215.56   10,343.28 10,693.52 7,475.64     10,199.30  

-             -            -            -            -              -             

-              -             
Awarded to: Total Amount:

11,186.97                     10,879.16                      13,070.48                      13,337.27                    10,605.25                      12,449.80                     
Cash Discount:

1%  10 days 1% 10 days
PO # Notes:

No bid - #21
No bid - Sec. C #20, 
Sections D+F

Remarks:

Summary



TABULATION OF COMPETITIVE BIDS
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Title: Safety Products
Bid Opened: 7/21/2010

3:00 PM

Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Section A

1 Leather Palm Safety Gloves doz 200 13.47       2,694.00   11.40       2,280.00   11.94       2,388.00   11.74       2,348.00   12.44       2,488.00   13.20       2,640.00   -            

2 Split Leather Palm Gloves pr 36 1.25         45.00         1.45         52.20         1.34         48.24         3.16         113.76      0.63         22.68         1.25         45.00         -            

3 Leather Cowhide Glove pr 36 4.20         151.20      3.77         135.72      3.36         120.96      2.98         107.28      0.84         30.18         3.75         135.00      -            

4 50%  50% , Latex coated pal doz 3 5.60         16.80         11.76       35.28         3.49         10.47         6.09         18.27         5.80         17.40         5.25         15.75         -            

5 Brown Jersey Knit Gloves doz 30 4.80         144.00      4.08         122.40      4.37         131.10      6.00         180.00      4.20         126.00      4.00         120.00      -            

6 Blue Nitrile Gloves doz 10 45.55       455.50      36.96       369.60      45.84       458.40      43.14       431.40      3.77         37.70         45.60       456.00      -            

7 Vinyl Disposable Gloves box 10 3.75         37.50         3.97         39.70         6.49         64.90         2.66         26.60         3.28         32.80         3.85         38.50         -            

8 Powder-free vinyl disp glove box 10 3.75         37.50         4.24         42.40         6.49         64.90         4.08         40.80         4.32         43.20         3.50         35.00         -            

9 North B-161 Butyl Gloves pr 40 14.35       574.00      12.45       498.00      14.48       579.20      14.30       572.00      15.20       608.00      13.95       558.00      -            

10 Best # 7005 N-Dex gloves box 10 9.25         92.50         9.25         92.50         10.49       104.90      8.00         80.00         10.00       100.00      8.25         82.50         -            

4,248.00   3,667.80   3,971.07   3,918.11   3,505.96   4,125.75   -            

Awarded to: Total Amount:
4,248.00                      3,667.80                      3,971.07                      3,918.11                      3,505.96                       8,251.50                       -                                

Cash Discount:

PO # Notes: #2 quoted by doz + ea 
price diff

#3 quoted per doz.

Remarks:

Section A
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Title: Safety Products
Bid Opened: 7/21/2010

3:00 PM

Item Description UOM Qty
Section B

11 Rain Jackets L ea 2 33.26       66.52        20.24       40.48         32.94       65.88         38.00       76.00         44.44       88.88        24.50       49.00        -           

12 Rain Jackets XL ea 40 33.26       1,330.40   20.24       809.60       32.94       1,317.60    38.00       1,520.00    44.44       1,777.60   24.50       980.00      -           

13 Rain Jackets 2XL ea 2 34.44       68.88        20.24       40.48         33.94       67.88         39.90       79.80         48.12       96.24        26.50       53.00        -           

14 Rain Jackets Yellow XL ea 3 10.30       30.90        20.24       60.72         25.14       75.42         16.47       49.41         16.36       49.08        17.50       52.50        -           

15 Rain Jackets Yellow 2XL ea 3 10.30       30.90        20.24       60.72         26.94       80.82         18.23       54.69         21.32       63.96        19.50       58.50        -           

16 Rain overalls ea 25 8.47         211.75      15.80       395.00       19.72       493.00       14.43       360.75       17.03       425.75      19.50       487.50      -           

17 Rain pants ea 10 8.47         84.70        15.80       158.00       19.72       197.20       14.43       144.30       17.03       170.30      16.50       165.00      -           

18 Rain Suit, C3, OSHA Ap ea 10 46.95       469.50      9.86         98.60         42.94       429.40       35.88       358.80       45.78       457.80      40.50       405.00      -           

2,293.55   1,663.60    2,727.20    2,643.75    3,129.61   2,250.50   -           
Section C

19 Black rubber boots pr 72 10.50       756.00      15.82       1,139.04    14.64       1,054.08    27.00       1,944.00    15.20       1,094.40   13.95       1,004.40   -           

20 2-buckle overshoes pr 4 19.69       78.76        12.22       48.88         18.94       75.76         27.00       108.00       no bid 18.75       75.00        -           

21 Rubbers pr 8 37.97       303.76      no bid 32.94       263.52       32.05       256.40       33.64       269.12      34.00       272.00      -           

22 Tingley Hazproof boots pr 40 61.90       2,476.00   62.59       2,503.60    64.94       2,597.60    59.57       2,382.80    62.52       2,500.80   67.00       2,680.00   -           

3,614.52   3,691.52    3,990.96    4,691.20    3,864.32   4,031.40   

Awarded to: Total Amount:
5,908.07                      5,355.12                      6,718.16                      7,334.95                      6,993.93                     3,864.32                     -                              

Cash Discount:

PO # Notes: #21 - no bid #20 - no bid

Remarks:

Sections B C
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Title: Safety Products
Bid Opened: 7/21/2010
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Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
Section D

23 Vests #8048OC-2 ea 75 5.00         375.00      12.34          925.50      8.34         625.50      16.47       1,235.25   no bid 17.00       1,275.00   -            

24 Vest #8048A ea 15 5.25         78.75        12.34          185.10      9.95         149.25      9.40         141.00      no bid 13.00       195.00      -            

453.75      1,110.60   774.75      1,376.25   -            1,470.00   -            

Section E

25 Hard Hats ea 24 5.35         128.40      7.11            170.64      5.25         126.00      9.29         222.96      4.39         105.36      5.35         128.40      -            

128.40      170.64      126.00      222.96      105.36      128.40      -            

Section F
26 Rain Jket/hood refle ea 25 17.95 448.75      23.00          575.00      59.22 1,480.50   19.4 485.00      no bid 17.75 443.75      -            

448.75      575.00      1,480.50   485.00      -            443.75      -            

Awarded to: Total Amount:
1,030.90                      1,856.24                         2,381.25                       2,084.21                       105.36                          2,042.15                       -                               

Cash Discount:

PO # Notes: No bid on Sections D + 
F

Remarks:

Sections D E F
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