
City of Bristol
TABULATION OF COMPETITIVE BIDS

Bid Number:
Title:
Bid Opened:

Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit PriceExtension

1 Hide A Way ea 72 68.88 4,959.36 65.00 4,680.00  60.49 4,355.28  59.25 4,266.00  66.42 4,782.24  64.25 4,626.00   88.00 6,336.00  no bid -        
2 Lighthead, Blue ea 24 50.40 1,209.60 47.50 1,140.00  49.40 1,185.60  51.76 1,242.24  48.60 1,166.40  52.75 1,266.00   69.00 1,656.00  no bid -        
3 Lighthead, Red ea 24 50.40 1,209.60 47.50 1,140.00  49.40 1,185.60  51.76 1,242.24  48.60 1,166.40  52.75 1,266.00   69.00 1,656.00  no bid -        
4 Swivel Bracket ea 42 19.04 799.68    18.00 756.00     22.39 940.38     19.55 821.10     18.36 771.12     23.11 970.62      25.40 1,066.80  no bid -        
5 Flange Kit ea 6 7.84 47.04      7.42 44.52       9.29 55.74       8.96 53.76       8.40 50.40       10.66 63.96        16.40 98.40       no bid -        
6 Head Light Flasher ea 12 40.32 483.84    38.00 456.00     42.50 510.00     41.41 496.92     38.88 466.56     46.71 560.52      63.20 758.40     no bid -        
7 Siren Speaker ea 12 99.00 1,188.00 139.39 1,672.68  122.00 1,464.00  151.25 1,815.00  142.02 1,704.24  205.15 2,461.80   187.00 2,244.00  no bid -        
8 Siren Spkr Bracket,FCV ea 9 18.48 166.32    17.49 157.41     14.00 126.00     18.98 170.82     17.82 160.38     24.77 222.93      34.80 313.20     no bid -        
9 Siren Spkr Brkt, Univ. ea 3 18.48 55.44      17.49 52.47       14.00 42.00       21.09 63.27       17.82 53.46       24.77 74.31        34.80 104.40     no bid -        

10 Remote Siren Amplifer ea 3 130.48 391.44    135.14 405.42     149.79 449.37     148.89 446.67     139.80 419.40     165.77 497.31      174.80 524.40     no bid -        
11 Amplifer Switch Controlle ea 9 347.76 3,129.84 329.13 2,962.17  367.39 3,306.51  357.14 3,214.26  372.60 3,353.40  433.49 3,901.41   402.60 3,623.40  no bid -        
12 Havis C-MC ea 9 5.75 51.75      7.70 69.30       7.90 71.10       7.38 66.42       8.00 72.00       8.09 72.81        12.70 114.30     6.74 60.66    
13 Havis C-MCB ea 9 7.57 68.13      9.80 88.20       9.50 85.50       9.39 84.51       10.00 90.00       10.16 91.44        14.80 133.20     12.00 108.00  
14 Havis C-ARM-102 ea 9 48.30 434.70    48.30 434.70     45.49 409.41     46.30 416.70     50.00 450.00     52.61 473.49      63.30 569.70     42.00 378.00  
15 Havis C-CUP2-1 ea 9 29.40 264.60    29.40 264.60     27.70 249.30     28.18 253.62     30.00 270.00     30.98 278.82      44.40 399.60     28.00 252.00  
16 Havis C-LP-3 ea 9 30.80 277.20    30.80 277.20     28.99 260.91     29.52 265.68     32.00 288.00     32.36 291.24      45.80 412.20     30.00 270.00  
17 Havis C-EB40-WX-1P ea 9 19.72 177.48    22.40 201.60     20.39 183.51     33.02 297.18     15.00 135.00     22.89 206.01      36.70 330.30     20.00 180.00  
18 Havis C-EB20-150 2" ea 9 13.45 121.05    19.60 176.40     18.39 165.51     18.79 169.11     20.00 180.00     20.82 187.38      34.60 311.40     17.50 157.50  
19 Havis C-FP-4 ea 9 6.24 56.16      9.10 81.90       8.55 76.95       8.72 78.48       10.00 90.00       9.97 89.73        14.10 126.90     12.00 108.00  
20 Havis C-FP-35 ea 9 6.24 56.16      9.10 81.90       8.55 76.95       8.72 78.48       10.00 90.00       9.97 89.73        14.10 126.90     12.00 108.00  
21 Havis C-FP-35 ea 9 8.27 74.43      9.10 81.90       8.55 76.95       8.72 78.48       10.00 90.00       9.97 89.73        14.10 126.90     12.00 108.00  
22 Havis C-FP-1 ea 9 5.28 47.52      7.70 69.30       7.20 64.80       7.38 66.42       8.00 72.00       8.59 77.31        12.70 114.30     10.00 90.00    
23 Havis C-FP-05 ea 9 5.28 47.52      7.70 69.30       7.20 64.80       7.38 66.42       8.00 72.00       8.59 77.31        12.70 114.30     12.00 108.00  
24 Havis CG-X Chargeguardea 12 60.00 720.00    63.00 756.00     59.39 712.68     64.82 777.84     65.00 780.00     64.10 769.20      80.00 960.00     58.00 696.00  

Awarded to: Total Amnt:

Terms 2% 10 days; net 30 4% 1 day; net 30?
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