
City of Bristol
TABULATION OF COMPETITIVE BIDS

Bid Number:
Title:
Bid Opened:

Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

1 S28 ea 1 38,958.25    42710 42,710.00    46320.00 46,320.00    no bid
Body Make Hi-Way Henderson Viking no bid
Body Model XT3-1 Muni Proline Gen II no bid
Opt 1A ea 1 6892 7400 8329.62 no bid
Opt 1B ea 2 4502 4900 4900.00 no bid
Tank Make Hi-Way Henderson Viking no bid
Tank Model XT3SMSS PT75x2 PT150 no bid
Tank Size Dual 35 150 Gal 150 Gal no bid

2 S29 ea 1 38958.25 38,958.25    42710 42,710.00    46320.00 46,320.00    no bid
Opt 2A ea 1 6892 7400 8329.62 no bid
Opt 2B ea 2 4502 4900 4900.00 no bid
Tank Make Hi-Way Henderson Vking no bid
Tank Model XT3SMSS PT75x2 PT150 no bid
Tank Size Dual 35 150 Gal 150 Gal no bid

3 S14 ea 1 6680 6,680.00      24480 24,480.00    no alternate 6992 6,992.00      
Opt 3A ea 2 3665 4900 no alternate 3290
Tank Make Hi-Way Henderson no alternate Titan
Tank Model HWVI5OME PT 75x2 no alternate T100-2
Tank Size Dual 75 Gal 150 Gal no alternate Dual Tanks

4 S16 ea 1 6680 6,680.00      24480 24,480.00    no alternate 6992 6,992.00      
Opt 4A ea 2 3665 7,330.00      4900 no alternate 3290
Tank Make Hi-Way Henderson no alternate Titan
Tank Model HWVI5OME PT75x2 no alternate T100-2
Tank Size Dual 75 Gal 150 Gal no alternate Dual 100 Gal

5 GS15 ea 1 6680 6,680.00      24480 24,480.00    no alternate 6992 6,992.00      
Opt 5A ea 2 3665 7,330.00      4900 9,800.00      no alternate 3290
Tank Make Hi-Way Henderson no alternate Titan
Tank Model HWVI5OME PT75x2 no alternate T100-2
Tank Size Dual 75 Gal 150 Gal no alternate Dual 100 Gal

*** Time of complete repair from p/u to del.
Calendar Days for Item 1
Calendar Days for Item 2
Calendar Days for Item 3
Calendar Days for Item 4
Calendar Days for Item 5

Date Trucks to be picked up for repair
Item 1 6/15/2011 7/18/2011 7/18/2011 blank
Item 2 6/15/2011 7/18/2011 7/18/2011 blank
Item 3 7/30/2011 6/1/2011 n/a 6/6/2011
Item 4 7/30/2011 6/1/2011 n/a 6/6/2011
Item 5 7/30/2011 6/1/2011 n/a 6/6/2011

Exceptions to this bid

Repair Warranty
Total Amount: 20,976.00                          112,616.50                        168,660.00                        92,640.00                          
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