
City of Bristol, CT
Bid Tabulation Results

Bid Number: 2011-009

Title 2 Investments LLC

SPA Defense

Daniel Defense

ProFoce Law 

Enforcement

CT Police SupplyTitle: Firearms Equip

Bid Opened: 7/27/2010
11:30 AM

Item Description UOM Qty Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

1 Rifles EA 11 1029 11,319.00    no bid 1334.55 14,680.05    no bid no bid
-               -               

2 Optics EA 11 535.08 5,885.88      no bid 600.00 6,600.00      578.41 6,362.51      568 6,248.00      

3 Light Kit EA 11 274.28 3,017.08      no bid 363 3,993.00      371.59 4,087.49      360 3,960.00      

4 Sling EA 11 63.91 703.01         no bid 30.66 337.26         17.64 194.04         no bid

5 Magazines EA 33 13.95 460.35         14.75 486.75         12 396.00         12.96 427.68         no bid

6 Install/Assemble LS 1 no bid no bid 0 -               no bid no bid

7 Night Scope EA 1 10602.32 10,602.32    9800 9,800.00      11760 11,760.00    no bid no bid

8 -               -               -               -               -               

9 -               -               -               -               -               

10 -               -               -               -               -               
Awarded to: Total Amount:

31,987.64                          10,286.75                          37,766.31                          11,071.72                          10,208.00                          
Cash Discount: Item 5-Lancer LS 30

translucent not black
PO # Delivery:

Remarks:


	Portrait

